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This contract document may be executed in counterparts, each of which shall•1e deemed an original, all 
of which together shall constitute one and the same instrument. Facsimile signatures will be regarded 
as authentic by all parties. 

Please direct any questions concerning this modification lo the Contracting Office! 

(A) The purpose of Modification 13 is to: 

I. lncrcase the funding on contract from $65,403,684 by $1,436,953 to $66,840,637. This leaves 
$3,059,436 to fund. 

(B) As a result the following Clauses have been modified. 

8·6. 152.232-720 Limitation of Funds- Fixed Price Contract (JAN 2004) 

(a) This firm-flxecJ.-price contract is incrementally funded. The sum of $66,841),63 7 is presently 
available for payment and is allotted to this contract. The pa1iies contemplate that the Government will 
allot funds to this contract in accordance with the following sehedule: 

On execution of this modification $66,840,637 
Provide additional funding by February 2008 

(b) The Contractor agrees to perfonn up to the point at which the total amount payHble by the 
Government, including reimbursement in the event of termination for the Government's convenience, 
approximates the total amount currently allotted to the contract. The Contractor will not be obligated to 
continue work on this contract beyond that point. The Government is not oblig~ted to reimburse the 
Contractor for costs incurred in excess of the total amount allotted to this contract by the Government 
notwithstanding any language to the contrary in clauses elsewhere in this contract including but not 
limited to "Type of Contract and Consideration" and "Termination for Convemence of the 
Government." As used in this clause, the total amount payable by the Government in the event of 
termination for convenience inclucJ.es costs incurred for work perfonned prior to termination, profit on 
work done by the Contractor for the terminated portion, and estimated termination settlement costs. 

(c) Notwithstanding the dates specified in the allotment schedule in paragraph ta) of this clause, the 
Contractor will notify the Contracting Officer in writing at least 90 days before the date when, in the 
Contractor's best judgment, the total amount payable by the Government (including any cost for 
termination for convenience), will approximate 85 percent of the total amount allotted to the contract. 
The notification will state (1) the estimated date when the Contractor will reach the gs percent point 
and (2) an estimate of additional !i.mcJ.ing, if any, needed to continue pcrformanc:e of the c<mtract up to 
the next scheduled date for allotment of funds identified in paragraph (a) of this clause, or to a mutually 
agreed upon substitute date. The notification will also advise the Contracting Officer of the estimated 
amount of additional funds that will be required for the timely performance of tne contract effort 
funded pursuant to this clause, for a subsequent period as may be specified in the allotment schedule in 
paragraph (a) of this clause or otherwise agreecJ. to by the parties. If the Govemmcnt does not allot 
additional funds by the date identified in the Contractor's notification, or by an agreed substitute date 
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after such notification, the Contracting Officer will terminate any effort, for which additional funds 
have not been allotted, pursuant to the clause of this contract entitled "Termination for Convenience of 
the Government." 

(d) When the Government allots additional funds for continued performance ofthe contract, the parties 
will agree to the period of contract performance that will be covered by the funds. The provisions of 
paragraphs (b) through (d) of this clause will apply in like mamter to the additi<mal allotted funds and 
agreed substitute date, and the Contracting Officer will modify the contract accordingly. 

(e) Tf, solely by reason of failure of the Government to allot additional funds bv the dates indicated 
above in amounts sufficient for timely perfonnance of the contract, the Contractor incurs additional 
costs or is delayed in the pcrfonnance of the work under this contract and if additional funds are 
allotted, an equitable adjustment will be made in the price (including appropriate target, billing, and 
ceiling price where applicable) of the contract, or in the time of delivery, or both. Failure to agree to 
any such equitable adjustment hereunder will be a dispute concerning a question of fact within the 
meaning of the clause entitled "Disputes." 

(t) The Government may at any time before temunation allot additional funds tor performing the 
contract. 

(g) The tcnnination provisions of this clause do not limit the rights of the Government under the clause 
entitled "Default." The provisions of this clause are limited to the work and allotment of funds for the 
contract as set forth in paragraph (a) of this clause. This clause no longer applks once the Government 
fully funds the contract, except with regard to the rights or obligations of the purtie~ conceming 
equitable adjustments negotiated under paragraphs (d) and (e) of this clause. 

(h) Nothing in this clause affects the right of the Government to terminate thb contract pursuant to the 
clause of this contract entitled ''Tennination for Convenience of the Government." 

B-7. 152.232-724 Allotted Contract l<'unding (JAN 2004) 

Pursuant to the "Limitation of Funds" clause, the funding presently availanle and allotted for the 
performance of this contract is set forth below. The Government shall not be obligated to reimburse the 
Contractor for costs incurred in excess of this amount and the Contractor shall not be obligated to 
continue performance under this contract or otherwise incur costs in excess of the stipulated amount. 
The Government estimates that the allotment will cover the pt::riod ofperformaiH.:e identified below: 

Allotted: $66,840,637 

Additional funding will be provided by February 2008 

(C) All other tem1s and conditions remain unchanged. 
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